4101:8-1-01 Administration.

[Comment: When a reference is made within this rule to a federal statutory
provision, an industry consensus standard, or any other technical publication, the
specific date and title of the publication as well as the name and address of the
promulgating agency are listed in rule 4101:8-43-01 of the Administrative Code.
The application of the referenced standards shall be limited and as prescribed in
section 102.5 of rule 4101:8-1-01 of the Administrative Code.]

SECTION 101
GENERAL

101.1 Title. Chapters 4101:8-1 to 4101:8-25, 4101:8-29, 4101:8-34, and 4101:8-
44 of the Administrative Code are designated as the ““Residential Code of Ohio
for One-, Two-, and Three-Family Dwellings™ for which the designation “RCO”
may be substituted. The 2009 edition of the ““International Residential Code”,
first printing, Chapters 2 though 24, 29, and 44 as published by the
“International Code Council, Inc.” is used as the basis of this document as is
incorporated fully except as modified in italic herein. References in these chapters
to “this code”, to the *““residential code”, or to the “Residential Code of Ohio™ in
other sections of the Administrative Code shall mean the *““Residential Code of
Ohio for One-, Two-, and Three-Family Dwellings”.

101.2 Scope. The provisions of the “Residential Code of Ohio for One-, Two-,
and Three-Family Dwellings” shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location, maintenance, removal, and demolition of every one-, two-, or three-
family dwelling, any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or
structures, or any accessory structures. No building or its equipment or
accessories, to which the rules of the board apply shall be erected, constructed, or
installed, except in conformity with the rules of the board.

This code also applies to such other residential occupancies as referenced and to
the extent indicated in section 310 of the “OBC”’.

Exceptions:
1. Manufactured home units constructed under “24 CFR Part 3280,

“Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards™ and within the
scope of the rules adopted by the Ohio Manufactured Home Commission.



4101:8-1-01 2

This exception does not apply to alterations of, additions to, or changes of
occupancy of manufactured homes.

2. Multiple single-family dwelling structures more than three stories in height
and with more than three dwelling units.

a. The structure of one-, two-, and three-family dwellings which are more
than three stories in height shall comply with the structural requirements
of the OBC or section 106.5 of this code.

3. Residential buildings attached to occupancies that are within the scope of
the OBC shall comply with the requirements of the “OBC”’.

4. Buildings or structures which are incident to the use for agricultural
purposes of the land on which said buildings or structures are located,
provided such buildings or structures are not used in the business of retail
trade; for the purposes of this section, a building or structure is not
considered used in the business of retail trade if fifty per cent or more of the
gross income received from sales of products in the building or structure by
the owner or operator is from sales of products produced or raised in a
normal crop year on farms owned or operated by the seller (see sections
3781.06 and 3781.061 of the Revised Code);

5. Agricultural labor camps;

6. Type A or Type B family day-care homes, except for the inspection required
for licensure by the “Ohio Department of Jobs and Family Services
(ODJFS)”. This required inspection shall be conducted by the certified
building department having jurisdiction in accordance with the inspection
checklist found on the board of building standard’s website.;

7. Buildings or structures which are designed, constructed, and maintained in
accordance with federal standards and regulations and are used primarily
for federal and state military purposes where the U.S. secretary of defense,
pursuant to 10 U.S.C. Sections 18233(A)(1) and 18237, has acquired by
purchase, lease, or transfer, and constructs, expands, rehabilitates, or
corrects and equips, such buildings or structures as he determines to be
necessary to carry out the purposes of Chapter 1803 of the U.S.C.



4101:8-1-01 3

8. Sewerage systems, treatment works, and disposal systems (including the
tanks, piping, and process equipment associated with these systems)
regulated by the legislative authority of a municipal corporation or the
governing board of a county or special district owning or operating a
publicly owned treatment works or sewerage system as stated in division
(A) of section 6111.032 of the Revised Code.

9. Building sewer piping.

101.3 Intent. The purpose of this code is to establish uniform minimum
requirements for the erection, construction, repair, alteration, and maintenance
of residential buildings, including construction of industrialized units. Such
requirements shall relate to the conservation of energy, safety, and sanitation of
buildings for their intended use and occupancy with consideration for the
following:

1. Performance. Establish such requirements, in terms of performance objectives
for the use intended. Further, the rules shall consider the following:

1.1 The impact that the state residential building code may have upon the
health, safety, and welfare of the public;

1.2 The economic reasonableness of the residential building code;
1.3 The technical feasibility of the residential building code;

1.4 The financial impact that the residential building code may have on the
public's ability to purchase affordable housing.

2. Extent of use. Permit to the fullest extent feasible, the use of materials and
technical methods, devices, and improvements which tend to reduce the cost
of construction without affecting minimum requirements for the health, safety,
and security of the occupants of buildings without preferential treatment of
types or classes of materials or products or methods of construction.

3. Standardization. To encourage, so far as may be practicable, the standardiza-
tion of construction practices, methods, equipment, material and techniques,
including methods employed to produce industrialized units.



4101:8-1-01 4

This code does not prevent a local governing authority from adopting
additional regulations governing residential structures if the regulations
comply with this section.

3.1. A local governing authority shall, and any person may, notify the board
of building standards of any regulation the local governing authority
adopts related to content within the scope of this code and request that
the board of building standards te determine whether that regulation
conflicts with the state residential building code.

3.1.1. Not later than sixty days after receiving a notice to review local
regulations for conflict, the board shall determine, based upon a
recommendation from the advisory committee, whether the
regulation conflicts with the state residential building code and
shall notify any person who submitted the notice and the local
governing authority that adopted the regulation of the board's
determination.

3.1.2 If the board determines that a conflict does not exist, the board
shall take no further action with regard to the regulation. If the
board determines a conflict exists and the regulation is not
necessary to protect the health or safety of the persons within the
local governing authority's jurisdiction, the regulation is not valid
and the local governing authority may not enforce the regulation.

3.1.3 If the board determines that a conflict exists and that the
regulation is necessary to protect the health or safety of the
persons within the local governing authority's jurisdiction, the
board shall adopt a rule to incorporate the regulation into the state
residential building code. Until the rule becomes a part of the state
residential building code, the board shall grant a temporary
variance to the local governing authority and any similarly
situated local governing authority to which the board determines
the temporary variance should apply.

101.4 Reasonable application. The rules of the board and proceedings shall be
liberally construed in order to promote its purpose. When the residential building
official finds that the proposed design is a reasonable interpretation of the
provisions of this code, it shall be approved. Materials, equipment and devices



4101:8-1-01 5

approved by the building officials pursuant to section 114 shall be constructed
and installed in accordance with such approval.

SECTION 102
APPLICABILITY AND JURISDICTIONAL AUTHORITY

102.1 General. Where, in any specific case, different sections of this code specify
different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, the most
restrictive shall govern. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement
and a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable.

102.2 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of state or federal law. Municipal corporations may make further and
additional regulations, not in conflict with Chapters 3781. and 3791. of the
Revised Code or with the rules of the board of building standards. However
approval by the board of building standards of any fixture, device, material,
system, assembly or product of a manufacturing process, or method or manner of
construction or installation shall constitute approval for their use anywhere in
Ohio.

102.3 Rules of the board. As provided in division (B) of section 3781.11 of the
Revised Code, the rules of the board of building standards shall supersede and
govern any order, standard, or rule of the divisions of state fire marshal or
industrial compliance in the department of commerce, and the department of
health and of counties and townships, in all cases where such orders, standards
or rules are in conflict with the rules of the board of building standards, except
that rules adopted and orders issued by the fire marshal pursuant to Chapter
3743. of the Revised Code prevail in the event of a conflict.

The rules of the board of building standards adopted pursuant to section 3781.10
of the Revised Code shall govern any rule or standard adopted by the board
pursuant to sections 4104.02 and 4105.011 of the Revised Code.

102.4 Application of references. References to chapter or section numbers, or to
provisions not specifically identified by number, shall be construed to refer to
such chapter, section or provision of this code.

102.5 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in
this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the



4101:8-1-01 6

prescribed extent of each such reference. When a reference is made within the
code to a federal statutory provision, an industry consensus standard, or any
other technical publication, the specific date and title of the publication as well as
the name and address of the promulgating agency are listed in Chapter 44 43.

Unless specified otherwise in this code, reference to the term “International
Residential Code™ shall be changed to *‘residential code’; reference to
“International Fire Code” shall be changed to ““fire prevention code”; and
reference in design and construction provisions to “one-and two-family
dwellings” shall be changed to “one-, two-, and three-family dwellings.”

Because the ““International Code Council” has placed design and construction
information throughout its model code documents, including into the fire
prevention code, any referenced code requirements relating to the design,
construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment,
use and occupancy, location, removal, and demolition of every building or
structure within the scope of this code, shall be enforced by the residential
building official.

Where differences occur between provisions of this code and referenced
standards listed in Chapter 44, the provisions of this code shall apply.

102.6 Partial invalidity. In the event any part or provision of this code is held to
be illegal or void, this shall not have the effect of making void or illegal any of the
other parts or provisions thereof, and it shall be presumed that this code would
have been adopted without such illegal or invalid parts or provisions.

102.7 Existing structures. The provisions of section 113 shall control the
alteration, repair, addition, maintenance, and change of occupancy of any
existing structure.

The occupancy of any structure currently existing on the date of adoption of this
code shall be permitted to continue without change provided there are no orders
of the residential building official pending, no evidence of fraud, or no serious
safety or sanitation hazard. When requested, such approvals shall be in the form
of a “Certificate of Occupancy for an Existing Building” in accordance with
section 111.



4101:8-1-01 7

Buildings constructed in accordance with plans which have been approved prior
to the effective date of this code are existing buildings.

102.8 Non-required work. Any component, building element, equipment, system
or portion thereof not required by this code shall be permitted to be installed
provided that it is constructed or installed in accordance with this code to the
extent of the installation.

102.8.1 Fire protection systems. Non-required fire protection systems shall
be installed in accordance with NFPA 13 or NFPA 13D to the extent of the
intended installation.

102.8.2 Elevators and lifts. When a non-required elevator is intended to be
installed, it shall be designed and installed in accordance with the residential
elevator provisions in Chapter 10 of the ANSI A17.1. Non-required platform
(wheelchair) lifts shall be designed and installed in accordance with ASME
Al18.1.

102.9 Temporary structures. The residential building official is authorized to
issue approvals for temporary structures. Such approvals shall be in the form of a
“Certificate of Occupancy for a Temporary Building™ in accordance with section
111.1.5. This section does not apply to time-limited occupancies in existing
structures. See section 111.1.4 for time-limited occupancies.

102.9.1 Conformance. Temporary structures shall conform to the structural
strength, fire safety, means of egress, accessibility, light, ventilation and
sanitary requirements of this code as necessary to ensure the public health,
safety and general welfare.

102.9.2 Termination of approval. The residential building official is
authorized to terminate approval for a temporary structure and to order the
temporary structure to be discontinued if conditions of the approval have been
violated or the structure or use poses an immediate hazard to the public or
occupants of the structure.

102.10 Work exempt from approval. Approval shall not be required for the
following:

Building:



4101:8-1-01 8

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed two
hundred square feet (11.15 m?) and playground structures.

2. Fences not over six feet (1829 mm) high.

3. Retaining walls which are not over four feet (1219 mm) in height
measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless
supporting a surcharge.

4. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed
five thousand gallons (18 927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or
width does not exceed two to one.

5. Sidewalks and driveways not more than thirty inches (762 mm) above
grade and not over any basement or story below and which are not part of
an accessible route.

6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar
finish work.

7. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to a one, two, or three-
family dwelling.

8. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more
than fifty-four inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require
additional support.

9. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18.58 m?)in area, that are not more
than 30 inches (762mm) above grade at any point, are not attached to a
dwelling, and do not serve the exit door required by section 311.4.

Electrical:

1. Listed cord-and-plug connected temporary decorative lighting.
2. Reinstallation of attachment plug receptacles but not the outlets thereof.

3. Replacement of branch circuit overcurrent devices of the required



4101:8-1-01 9

capacity and type in the same location.

4. Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus, or equipment operating
at less than 25 volts and not capable of supplying more than 50 watts of
energy.

5. Repairs and Maintenance: Approval shall not be required for minor
repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection of
approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed
receptacles.

Gas:

1. Portable heating, cooking, or clothes drying appliances;

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment
or make such equipment unsafe.

3. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping
system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

4. Gas distribution piping owned and maintained by public or municipal
utilities and located upstream of the point of delivery.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliances;

2. Portable ventilation equipment;

3. Portable cooling units;

4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling
equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment
or make such equipment unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.



4101:8-1-01 10

7. Self-contained refrigeration systems containing ten pounds (4.54 kg) or
less of refrigerant or that are actuated by motors of one horsepower (746
W) or less.

8. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping
system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

9. Heating and cooling distribution piping owned and maintained by public
or municipal utilities.

Plumbing:

1. The repair of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided,
however, that if any concealed trap, drain-pipe, water, soil, waste or vent
pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace
the same with new material, such work shall be considered as new work
and an approval shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this
code.

2. The clearance of stoppages or the repair of leaks in pipes, valves or
fixtures, and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided
such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or rearrangement
of valves, pipes or fixtures.

102.10.1 Emergency repairs. Where equipment replacements and repairs
must be performed in an emergency situation, an application for approval
shall be submitted within the next working business day to the building
official.

102.10.2 Minor repairs. Minor repairs to structures may be to residential
structures made without application or notice to the residential building
official. Such repairs shall not include the cutting away of any wall, partition
or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or load
bearing support, or the removal or change of any required means of egress,
or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the egress requirements;
nor shall ordinary repairs include addition to, alteration of, replacement or
relocation of any standpipe, water supply, sewer, drainage, drain leader, gas,
soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric wiring or mechanical or other
work affecting public health or general safety.



4101:8-1-01 11

102.11 Building department jurisdictional limitations. A municipal, township,
or county residential building department that has been certified by the board of
building standards, pursuant to section 103.2, shall enforce provisions of the
rules of the board and of Chapters 3781. and 3791. of the Revised Code, relating
to construction, arrangement, and the erection of residential buildings or parts
thereof as defined in the rules of the board in accordance with the certification
except as follows:

1.

Fire. The fire chief of municipal corporations or townships, having fire
departments, shall enforce all provisions of the rules of the board relating
to fire prevention.

Health. The department of health, the boards of health of city or general
health districts, or the residential departments of building inspection of
municipal corporations, townships, or counties shall enforce such
provisions relating to sanitary construction.

Sewerage and drainage system. In accordance with Section 3781.03 of
the Revised Code, the department of the city engineer, in cities having
such departments, the boards of health of health districts, or the sewer
purveyor, as appropriate, shall have complete supervision and regulation
of the entire sewerage and drainage system of the jurisdiction, including
the building sewer and all laterals draining into the street sewers. Such
department or agency shall have control and supervision of the
installation and construction of all drains and sewers that become a part
of the sewerage system of the jurisdiction and shall issue all the necessary
permits and licenses for the construction and installation of all building
sewers and of all other lateral drains that empty into the main sewers.
Such department or agency shall keep a permanent record of the
installation and location of every drain and sewerage system of the city.

Enforcement. This section does not exempt any officer or department
from the obligation of enforcing any provision of the rules of the board.

State Projects. Certification does not confer any jurisdiction to a certified
building department to:



4101:8-1-01 12

5.1 The construction of buildings by the state of Ohio or on land owned by
the state of Ohio including, but is not limited to, its agencies,
authorities, boards, commissions, administrative departments,
instrumentalities, community or technical college districts, but does
not include other political subdivisions.

Exception: Local school district building projects funded by the Ohio
school facilities commission in accordance with Chapter 3318. of the
Revised Code where the local certified building department is
authorized by the board to regulate construction of school facilities.

5.2 Park districts created pursuant to Chapter 1545. of the Revised Code.

Note: The lands owned by Miami university in the city of Oxford and Oxford
township in Butler County and leased to private individuals or corporations
under the land rent provisions of the Act of February 17, 1809, as set forth at
7 Ohio laws 184, are subject to local certified building department
jurisdiction and are exempt from these provisions.

SECTION 103
CERTIFIED RESIDENTIAL BUILDING DEPARTMENTS, PERSONNEL,
AND APPEALS BOARDS

103.1 General. Before exercising authority in the enforcement of the rules of the
Board and before accepting and approving residential plans, municipal, township
and county residential building departments and their required personnel shall be
certified by the board of building standards as required in section 3781.10 of the
Revised Code.

Applications submitted to the board of building standards for certifications shall
be made on prescribed forms according to the provisions of this section.

103.2 Building department certification.  Municipalities, townships, and
counties may seek certification by the board of building standards as described in
division (E) of section 3781.10 of the Revised Code to exercise enforcement
authority, to accept and approve residential construction documents, and to make
inspections.



4101:8-1-01 13

103.2.1  Certification types. A political subdivision may seek to enforce the
rules of the board by requesting either a certification as a residential building
department or a residential sub-building department as required in sections
103.2.1.1 or 103.2.1.2. References in this chapter to ““residential department”
or “building department™, unless specified, shall mean “certified residential
building department™ or “certified residential sub-building department.”

103.2.1.1 Certification as a residential building department.
Municipalities, townships, and counties shall enforce the rules of the
board in conformity with the law and as described in sections
103.2.1.1.1 and 103.2.1.1.2.

103.2.1.2 Municipalities.  Municipalities, in  submitting the
application described in section 103.2.3, must specify whether the
residential department is to be certified to enforce the rules of the
board for plumbing and will employ a certified plumbing inspector as
required in section 103.3. If a residential department is not to be
certified for plumbing, the enforcement shall be done by the local
board of health.

Municipalities may, at any time, make application to the board of
building standards to be approved to have the building department
certification modified or to include or exclude plumbing enforcement
duties in accordance with section 103.2.8.

103.2.1.1.2 Counties and townships. Counties and townships, in
submitting the application described in section 103.2.3 for
certification of a residential building department, are not certified to
enforce plumbing provisions or employ plumbing inspectors required
in section 103.3. As permitted in section 3703.01 of the Revised Code,
county residential building departments may enforce plumbing
provisions if the county board of health has entered into an agreement
with the board of county commissioners to provide plumbing code
enforcement and employs a plumbing inspector certified as required in
division (D) of section 3703.01 of the Revised Code. The county shall
specify on its application whether the county residential department
will enforce the rules of the board for plumbing and will employ a
properly certified plumbing inspector. If, after certification, a county
residential building department assumes plumbing code enforcement



4101:8-1-01 14

as required in section 3703.01 of the Revised Code, it shall notify the
board.

Counties and townships may, at any time, make application to the
board of building standards to be approved to have the building
department certification modified or to include or exclude medical gas
piping system enforcement duties in accordance with section 103.2.8.

103.2.1.3 Certification as a residential sub-building department.
Municipalities, townships, and counties may be certified by the board of
building standards to enforce the rules of the board as a residential sub-
building department in conformity with the law and as described in
sections 103.2.1.2.1 and 103.2.1.2.2. A residential sub-building
department has enforcement exercised on their behalf by another certified
political subdivision that will perform all enforcement, reporting, and
administrative duties.

103.2.1.3.1 Municipalities. Municipalities, in submitting the
application described in section 103.2.3, must specify whether the
department is to be certified as a residential sub-building department
and shall indicate which certified residential building department of
another political subdivision will enforce the rules of the board in the
municipality. The application must also specify how the public in a
municipality with a certified residential sub-building department will
be provided information on how construction documents will be
accepted, reviewed, and approved, and how inspections will be
requested and made.

Municipalities may, at any time, make application to the board of
building standards to be approved to have the residential building
department certification modified to change its certification from a
residential sub-building department to a certified residential building
department, or vice versa, in accordance with section 103.2.8.1.

103.2.1.3.2 Counties and townships. Counties and townships,
in submitting the application described in section 103.2.3, must specify
whether the department is to be certified as a residential sub-building
department and shall indicate which certified residential building
department of another political subdivision will enforce the rules of



4101:8-1-01 15

the board in the county or township. The county or township must also
specify how the public in the county or township with a certified
residential sub-building department will be provided information on
how construction documents will be accepted and approved, and how
inspections will be requested and made.

Counties and townships may, at any time, make application to the
board of building standards to be approved to have the residential
building department certification modified to change its certification
from a residential sub-building department and to a residential
certified building department, or vice versa, in accordance with
section 103.2.8.1.

103.2.2 Building department certification requirements. To qualify for
certification, a municipal, township, or county shall comply with the
following:

1. Conformity with law. The residential department shall submit an
application and shall have been created in conformity with the law,
shall have adopted ordinances or resolutions, and shall have entered
into any agreements or contracts necessary to comply with the rules of
the board and section 103.2.3.

1.1 A political subdivision with a nonresidential building department
certified pursuant to OBC section 103.1, qualifies for certification
to enforce the Residential Code of Ohio. The political subdivision
must submit an application for additional -certification in
accordance with section 103.2.1. Personnel shall be qualified
pursuant to and the department shall comply with the
requirements of this section.

2. Required personnel. A certified residential building department or
residential sub-building department shall have the following personnel
qualified to execute the duties required for the exercise of enforcement
authority, the review and approval of construction documents, and the
performance of inspections under the rules of the board. All personnel
of municipal, township, or county residential building departments,
and persons and employees of persons, firms, or corporations whose
responsibilities include the exercise of enforcement authority shall be



4101:8-1-01 16

certified by the board of building standards pursuant to section 103.3
prior to performing such duties;

2.1 Residential building official. The residential building department
shall have in its employ or under contract one person appointed by
the municipality, township, or county holding a certification as a
residential building official.

2.2 Residential plans examiner. The residential building department
shall have in its employ or under contract at least one person
holding a certification as the residential plans examiner.

2.3 Residential building inspector. The residential building
department shall have in its employ or under contract at least one
person holding a certification as a residential building inspector.

2.4 Residential plumbing inspector. If the residential department is
certified to enforce plumbing provisions, then the residential
department shall have in its employ or under contract at least one
person holding the appropriate certification as a residential
plumbing inspector.

2.5 Electrical safety inspector. The residential building department
shall have in its employ or under contract at least one person
holding certification as an electrical safety inspector.

2.6 Backup personnel. The residential department shall have in its
employ or under contract, alternate personnel meeting the
requirements of this rule, to serve in the event of a conflict of
interest or the unavailability of the residential building official,
residential plans examiner or residential inspectors.

2.7 Replacement personnel. When required personnel leave the
employ of the residential department, permanent replacement
personnel shall be designated in accordance with the rules of the
Board within one hundred twenty days.



4101:8-1-01 17

3.

Elective personnel. The residential department may elect to have the
following personnel certified by the board of building standards
pursuant to section 103.3 prior to performing such duties;

3.1 Residential mechanical inspector. The residential department may
also have in its employ or under contract persons holding a
residential mechanical inspector certification.

3.4 Electrical plans examiner. The residential department may have in
its employ or under contract persons holding a certification as an
electrical plans examiner.

Contract employees. A municipal corporation, township, or county
may contract with a certified residential building department, health
district, or with persons, firms, or corporations under contract to
furnish services, and meeting the requirements of this rule, to exercise
enforcement authority, administer these rules, approve plans and
specifications and perform inspections on behalf of such municipal
corporation, township, or county, providing such authority is
exercised pursuant to such contract and upon application to and
approval by the board of building standards;

Residential building department office. The certified residential
building department shall have an office conveniently located within
the area it serves. The office shall be open and staffed to serve the
public need and office hours shall be conspicuously posted. If the
residential department contracts for its enforcement services, or is
certified as a residential sub-building department, information shall be
provided to the public explaining how residential building department
services shall be provided;

Availability of inspectors. The residential building department shall
be staffed so that all residential inspectors are available for requested
inspections as required in section 108.1; and

Residential building department certification, to be posted. The
certificate issued by the board of building standards to a municipal,
township, or county residential building department shall be posted in
a conspicuous place within the jurisdiction.



4101:8-1-01 18

103.2.3  Residential building department certification application.
Application for certification of a municipal, township, or county residential
building department shall be made on a form prescribed by the board of
building standards and shall set forth:

1.

2.

Copy of the law creating such a residential department.

Copy of a resolution requesting certification of the residential building
department to enforce the rules of the board.

The proposed budget for the operation of such residential department.

A chart showing the organization of the residential building
department within the governmental body.

Data reflecting the population and the size of the area to be served.

The number of and board certifications held by staff to be employed by
the residential building department.

. The names, addresses, and board certifications of persons, firms or

corporations contracting to furnish work or services when such
persons, firms, or corporations are under contract to furnish
architectural, engineering, or inspection services to the municipal
corporation, township, or county, and such authority is exercised
pursuant to such contract.

The names of other municipal corporations, townships, counties, or
health districts contracting to furnish work or services when such other
municipal corporation, township, county, or health district is under
contract to furnish architectural or engineering services to the
municipal corporation, township, or county, and such authority is
exercised pursuant to such contract and when officers or employees of
any other municipal corporation, township, county, or health district
under contract to furnish inspection services to the municipal
corporation, township, or county, when such authority is exercised
pursuant to such contract.



4101:8-1-01 19

9.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

A copy of the ordinance or resolution authorizing a residential
building department to enter into a contract with other municipalities,
townships, counties, health districts, persons, firms or corporations to
do their plan approval and inspections.

A copy of the contract between the residential building department
and other municipalities, townships, counties, health districts, persons,
firms, or corporations to do their plan approval or inspections.

The department within the municipality, township, or county which
will be responsible for plumbing inspection, if not within the
residential building department.

The applicant may attach any other charts, maps, statistical data or
other information which it determines may be beneficial to the board
in considering the applications for certification.

A procedure for plan approval and for performing inspections, a copy
of the plan review application, and a copy of the department's
approval stamp.

The board may allow amendments to applications prior to formal
action. Requests for amendments to applications shall be made in
writing and conform to all the other provisions of this rule.

An explanation of how a local appeals process will be established and
operate within the jurisdiction.

The original of the documents, papers and charts required in
paragraphs one to sixteen of this rule shall be filed with the board.

Signature of an authorized representative of the board of township
trustees in townships, the board of county commissioners in counties,
or the appropriate officials in municipalities.

If the department is requesting certification as a sub-department, the
application must also specify how the public in the jurisdiction with a
certified residential sub-building department will be provided
information on how construction documents will be accepted,



4101:8-1-01 20

reviewed, and approved, and how inspections will be requested and
made.

The board shall hold a hearing to take action on the application. The
applicant may be present at the hearing to respond to any questions from the
board and all interested persons appearing at such hearing may be given an
opportunity to comment. The board may establish a separate application form
with waived requirements for jurisdictions with certified non-residential
building departments seeking residential certification.

103.2.4 Residential building department certification, certification hearing.
Upon receipt of an application, the board of building standard’s certification
committee shall review the application and make a recommendation to the
board of building standards. The committee may ask for additional
information to be submitted by the applicant prior to making a
recommendation to the board. If the committee requests additional
information from the applicant, failure to submit the requested information
within ninety days from the date of the request may be cause for disapproval
of the application by the board. After receiving a recommendation from the
committee, a certification hearing on the application shall be conducted by
the board of building standards. An authorized representative of the
municipality, township, or county seeking certification present at the
certification hearing may give testimony or respond to any questions from the
board. The board shall give all interested persons appearing at such
certification hearing an opportunity to be heard and explain their positions. A
record of the proceeding shall be made by the board.

103.2.4.1 Residential building department certification, approval or
denial. Following the public hearing, the board shall act on the
application for certification.

Approval by the board of building standards of an application for
certification shall set forth the subject matters for which the municipal,
township, or county residential building department under consideration
is to be certified. After such approval, the appropriate official in
municipalities, the board of township trustees in townships, or the board
of county commissioners in counties requesting residential certification,
shall be furnished a certificate of approval which shall state the
conditions and limitations, if any, under which it has been issued.



4101:8-1-01 21

If the application is denied in whole or in part by the board of building
standards, the appropriate official in municipalities, the board of
township trustees in townships, or the board of county commissioners in
counties requesting residential certification shall be notified in writing of
such denial and the reason therefore and to their rights of appeal
pursuant to sections 3781.10, 3781.101, and Chapter 119. of the Revised
Code.

103.2.5 Residential building department certification, board to maintain list.
The board of building standards shall maintain a current list of all certified
nonresidential and residential building departments, their contact information
and, if applicable, their contractual relationships with other persons,
departments, firms, or corporations that enforce the rules of the board on
behalf of the certified residential building department.

The list of certified nonresidential and residential building departments shall
be made available upon request and shall be posted on the board’s website at
http://www.com.ohio.gov/dico/BBS.aspx.

103.2.6 Residential building department certification, reports, and
assessment.  Certified residential building departments shall submit the
following reports and information to the board of building standards:

1. A yearly operational report for the previous year, within ninety
calendar days after the end of each calendar year;

2. Written notification of changes in personnel of the building
department who enforce the rules of the board, within thirty calendar
days after such personnel have been appointed;

3. Replies to any special requests or queries made by the board of
building standards, within thirty calendar days of receipt;

4. Copies of revised contracts or agreements, within thirty calendar days
after the department creates or changes a contractual relationship
with another department or firm.

103.2.6.1 Board assessment. Each political subdivision that



4101:8-1-01 22

prescribes fees pursuant to division (E) of section 3781.102 of the Revised
Code shall also collect on behalf of the board of building standards an
assessment equal to one per cent of those fees imposed for approvals, for
the acceptance and approval of plans and specifications, and for
performing inspections.

103.2.6.1.1  Assessment report. The residential building official shall
report on the prescribed form and remit monthly by check, the amount
of the assessments collected on behalf of the board not later than sixty
days following the end of each month in which the assessments are
collected. In the case of residential building departments under
contract to exercise enforcement authority pursuant to section
103.2.1.2, the residential building official shall report and remit to the
Board for all certified residential sub-building departments. Checks
shall be made payable to the “Treasurer, State of Ohio™.

103.2.7  Residential building department certification, revocation or
suspension. Upon petition to the board of building standards by any person
affected by the exercise of the authority granted under such certification, or by
the board on its own motion, in accordance with division (E) of section
3781.10 of the Revised Code, a residential department certification may be
revoked or suspended.

103.2.7.1 Residential building department certification, hearings and
appeals. Hearings shall be held by the board of building standards and
appeals shall be permitted on any proceedings for certification as
provided in section 119.07 of the Revised Code and in sections 103.3.6.1.1
and 103.3.6.1.2.

103.2.7.1.1 Complaint process. Upon receipt of a written complaint
against a certified residential building department that is
substantiated by demonstrable evidence or upon the board’s own
motion:

1. The board shall decide whether the information submitted
warrants causing a formal investigation to be initiated or
sending a notice for public hearing as outlined in item 4 below;



4101:8-1-01

2.

23

If a formal investigation is warranted, the certified jurisdiction
shall be notified that an investigation has been initiated by the
board;

Upon completion of the investigation, findings shall be reported
to the board.

The board may dismiss the complaint, table the matter for
future action, or initiate action to suspend or revoke the
certification. If the board issues an order to suspend or revoke
the certification, it shall:

4.1 Notify the certified jurisdiction of the charges by certified
mail, return receipt requested. The certified jurisdiction
shall be informed that a hearing, if desired, must be
requested within thirty days from the date of the mailing to
request a hearing before the board. The order shall inform
the certified jurisdiction that it may be represented by
counsel at the hearing. Failure by the certified jurisdiction
to request a hearing within thirty days from the date of the
mailing of the notification may cause the board, after a
hearing, to uphold the order revoking or suspending
certification;

4.2 Schedule a hearing to be held seven to fifteen days after
receipt of the request. The board may continue or postpone
the hearing upon application by the party or upon its own
motion;

4.3 The board may appoint a hearing officer to conduct a
hearing.

4.4 A hearing will be conducted during which parties and
witnesses can be examined and offer testimony, in a
man